
Airport Flyer – Local Residents Scheme  - Travel Pass Application Form 

 

 

 

Bristol Airport operates a concessionary fare scheme for local residents on the Flyer 
Express Services A1 and A3 between Bristol Airport, Bristol and Weston-super-
Mare.  Any member of the public permanently resident within the qualifying 
catchment area can apply for the scheme. The scheme is available to anyone 
permanently resident in BS40, BS48, BS49, BS25, BS29 & BS41 8.  
 
Residents in these areas who are Diamond Card holders are able to travel free of 
charge on the Airport Flyer Express on production of a valid Diamond Card plus 
Bristol Airport’s concessionary travel scheme card (valid 24/7). 
 
To apply for the scheme please complete the details below and provide your  
supporting documentation via email only to: flyer@bristolairport.com 
 
Please also email a copy of a proof of address in support of your application – i.e. a 
valid driving Licence or Council Tax or Utility Bill (no more than six months old) 
 
Please allow 28 days for applications to be processed. 

Title: Mr/Mrs/Miss/Other 

(please state) 
 

Full Name  
 
 

Address  
 
 

Email  
 
 

  
I confirm that as the above named individual I am applying to join the Bristol Airport 
Flyer Local Community Concessionary Fare Scheme for my sole personal use as the 
permanent resident of the property stated above within the qualifying catchment 
area.  I accept the terms & conditions of the scheme and understand that any use of 
the pass outside these terms may result in membership of the scheme being 
withheld or withdrawn by Bristol Airport. 
 

Flyer Local 

Community Concessionary Scheme Terms and Conditions Dec 2020 (1).pdf
 

 
 
Signed: 
 
Dated: 
 
 

mailto:flyer@bristolairport.com
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Free travel will be granted when a valid Diamond Card is shown along with the local 
concession card. 
 
By applying for membership of the Airport Flyer Community Concessionary Travel 
scheme you agree to Bristol Airport processing personal data as detailed above for 
the purposes of administration of the scheme only.   
 
Bristol Airport will hold all data in accordance with the General Data Protection 
Regulations (GDPR). Your information will only be shared with our third-party 
security partner in order to complete your application. By completing this form, you 
give consent for Bristol Airport to contact you regarding administration of the 
scheme. Privacy Vision and Statement | Bristol Airport 
 

https://www.bristolairport.co.uk/privacy-policy

